
Project : 1271 - Oak Brook Park District - Family Recreation Center AHU Date:  12/4/2019

Owner: Oak Brook Park District Time:  11:00 a.m.
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Base Bid

Alternate

No. 1

Replace existing roof top 

portals

Total with
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1 Oak Brook Mechanical Elmhurst, IL Y Y Y $117,600.00 $5,200.00 $122,800.00

2 Mechanical Concepts Romeoville, IL Y Y Y $118,000.00 $5,500.00 $123,500.00

3 1 Source Mechanical Oak Brook, IL Y Y Y $136,998.00 $4,850.00 $141,848.00

4 MG Mechanical Woodstock, IL Y Y Y $131,850.00 $10,670.00 $142,520.00

5 Monaco Mechanical Lisle, IL Y Y Y $136,800.00 $6,800.00 $143,600.00

6 F.E. Moran Lemont, IL Y Y Y $137,000.00 $9,400.00 $146,400.00

7 Amber Mechanical Alsip, IL Y Y Y $159,000.00 $5,500.00 $164,500.00

8 C. Acitelli Heating Villa Park, IL Y Y Y $206,000.00 $4,600.00 $210,600.00

9 Artlip and Sons, Inc. Aurora, IL No Bid

10 Atlas Morton Grove, IL No Bid

BID TABULATION
Contract Type:  Single Contract, Stipulated Sum

Kluber Project No.:  19-310-1271
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During the December 16, 2019 Board Meeting, the Board of Park Commissioners accepted the base bid and alternate bid from Oak Brook Mechanical for a total cost of $122,800.00.
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11 Pro-Temp of Illinois Westchester, IL No Bid

12 Sherman Mechanical Cary, IL No Bid
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